


ITEM EST. UNIT TOTAL PRICE UNIT TOTAL PRICE UNIT TOTAL PRICE UNIT TOTAL PRICE UNIT TOTAL PRICE
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNITS PRICE PER ITEM PRICE PER ITEM PRICE PER ITEM PRICE PER ITEM PRICE PER ITEM

BASE BID ITEMS
1 Furnish and Install Automated Mechanical Bar

Screen No. 2 (Duperon FlexRake IQ),
Including Field Verifications of All Dimensions,
Level Sensor System, Demolition and
Removal of Existing Steel Plate Channel
Cover, Modifications to the Existing
Headworks and All Other Items Required for a
Complete and Operating System, Complete in
Place

1 LS $425,630.00 $425,630.00 $275,842.00 $275,842.00 $497,360.00 $497,360.00 $526,000.00 $526,000.00 $330,000.00 $330,000.00

2 Furnish and Install Automated Screenings
Conveyor / Compactor, Sized to Collect
Screenings from 2 Bar Screens, Including
Field Verification of All Dimensions,
Connection of Existing Non-Potable Water
System, Demolition and Removal of Existing
Conveyor / Compactor and All Components,
and All Appurtenances, Complete in Place

1 LS $148,942.00 $148,942.00 $249,993.00 $249,993.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $139,000.00 $139,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00

3 Replace Existing Controls and Cabinet with
Proposed Automated Mechanical Bar Screen
No. 2 Controls and Cabinet, Including Level
Transducer for Existing Automated
Mechanical Bar Screen No. 1, as Required for
a Complete and Operating System, Complete
in Place

1 LS $18,119.00 $18,119.00 $77,945.00 $77,945.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

4 Replace Existing Controls and Cabinet with
Proposed Conveyor / Compactor Controls and
Cabinet, as Required for a Complete and
Operating System, Complete in Place

1 LS $18,119.00 $18,119.00 $77,945.00 $77,945.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00

5 Electrical System Installation, Provide and
Install All Work Shown on Plans and
Described in Specifications, Including But Not
Limited to Bar Screen No. 2, Headworks Rack
No. 2, Vendor Supplied Equipment,
Replacement of Screw Compactor, and
Modifications to MCC No. 1, Provide and
Install Conduit, Wire, and All Ancillary Devices
as Shown on Construction Drawings and
Described in Specifications, Complete in Place

1 LS $31,515.00 $31,515.00 $32,889.00 $32,889.00 $76,000.00 $76,000.00 $64,000.00 $64,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

Reddico Construction Company, Inc

10083 Airport Road
Conroe, TX 77303

Wameco Construction, LLC
4939 Milwee Street,. Suite A 
Houston, TX 77092

JTR Constuctors, Inc.

Michael Hamlin 

Eagle Contracting 
8611 Derrington Road 
Houston, TX 77064Brookshire, TX 77423

32361 Morton Road
Brown & Root Industrial Services, LLC 

8799 North Loop East, Suite 212
Bid Tabulation - Bid Opening, April 9, 2026

FRN F-1386

Houston, TX 77029
713-824-4477

Bond Series 2021 Projects Wastewater Treatment Plant Improvements
LJA Project No. E208-0530

New Caney Municipal Utility District

Craig L. Cook 
craig.cook@brownandroot.com

713-203-3617281-550-7107
J. Ryan Redd 
rredd@reddico.com

832-401-6934936-441-9500
Tony F. Gonzalez 
tgonzalez@jtrconstructors.com

Marty Wells 
mwells@eaglecontracting.com mhamlin@wamecohtx.com

Page 2

mailto:craig.cook@brownandroot.com
mailto:rredd@reddico.com
mailto:tgonzalez@jtrconstructors.com
mailto:mwells@eaglecontracting.com
mailto:mhamlin@wamecohtx.com
mailto:craig.cook@brownandroot.com
mailto:rredd@reddico.com
mailto:tgonzalez@jtrconstructors.com
mailto:mwells@eaglecontracting.com
mailto:mhamlin@wamecohtx.com


ITEM EST. UNIT TOTAL PRICE UNIT TOTAL PRICE UNIT TOTAL PRICE UNIT TOTAL PRICE UNIT TOTAL PRICE
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNITS PRICE PER ITEM PRICE PER ITEM PRICE PER ITEM PRICE PER ITEM PRICE PER ITEM

Reddico Construction Company, Inc

10083 Airport Road
Conroe, TX 77303

Wameco Construction, LLC
4939 Milwee Street,. Suite A 
Houston, TX 77092

JTR Constuctors, Inc.

Michael Hamlin 

Eagle Contracting 
8611 Derrington Road 
Houston, TX 77064Brookshire, TX 77423

32361 Morton Road
Brown & Root Industrial Services, LLC 

8799 North Loop East, Suite 212
Bid Tabulation - Bid Opening, April 9, 2026

FRN F-1386

Houston, TX 77029
713-824-4477

Bond Series 2021 Projects Wastewater Treatment Plant Improvements
LJA Project No. E208-0530

New Caney Municipal Utility District

Craig L. Cook 
craig.cook@brownandroot.com

713-203-3617281-550-7107
J. Ryan Redd 
rredd@reddico.com

832-401-6934936-441-9500
Tony F. Gonzalez 
tgonzalez@jtrconstructors.com

Marty Wells 
mwells@eaglecontracting.com mhamlin@wamecohtx.com

6 Furnish and Install Screenings Collection
System, Including Steel Piping, Flex Piping,
Square Flange, Steel Dumping Hopper, Coring
of Concrete Wall (if required), and All
Appurtenances, in Accordance with Details on
Plans and Specifications, Complete in Place

1 LS $27,500.00 $27,500.00 $27,469.00 $27,469.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00

7 Owner's Contingency, As Directed by Owner's
Representative, Complete in Place

1 LS $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

SUB-TOTAL BASE BID ITEMS - ITEMS 1 - 7 $719,825.00 $792,083.00 $804,360.00 $814,000.00 $865,000.00

ALLOWANCE BID ITEM
8 Allowance for SCADA Panel Modifications,

SCADA Panel Wire Terminations, and
Programming, Completed by Electrical Field
Services, Inc.
(Van Johnson, 281-361-7455,
vjohnson@efservices.net)

1 LS $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

SUB-TOTAL ALLOWANCE BID ITEM - ITEM 8 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

ALTERNATE "A" BID ITEMS
9 Furnish and Install Additional Automated

Mechanical Bar Screen No. 1 (Duperon
FlexRake IQ), Including Field Verifications of
All Dimensions, Level Sensor System,
Demolition and Removal of Existing
Automated Mechanical Bar Screen,
Modifications to the Existing Headworks and
All Other Items Required for a Complete and
Operating System, Complete in Place

1 LS $275,222.00 $275,222.00 $281,456.00 $281,456.00 $235,367.00 $235,367.00 $217,000.00 $217,000.00 $340,000.00 $340,000.00

10 Increase/Deduct to Base Bid Item No. 5 for
Electrical Installation to Remove and Replace
Automated Mechanical Bar Screen No. 1,
Vendor Supplied Control Panel, Field
Instrumentation, and Install All Required
Appurtenances, As Shown on the Construction
Drawings and Described in he Specifications,
Complete in Place

1 LS $19,781.00 $19,781.00 $11,070.00 $11,070.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

SUB-TOTAL ALTERNATE "A" BID ITEMS - ITEMS 9 AND 10 $295,003.00 $292,526.00 $244,367.00 $226,000.00 $370,000.00
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ALTERNATE "B" BID ITEMS
11 Increase / Deduct to Overall Base Bid for

Utilizing Approved Alternate Manufacturers /
Models (HUBER Multi-Rake RakeMax),
Including All Items Required for a Complete
and Operating System, Complete in Place
(Successful Bidder to provide breakdown of
modified pricing for each Base Bid Item prior
to Execution of Contract Documents)

1 LS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

12 Increase / Deduct to Overall Alternate "A" Bid
for Utilizing Approved Alternate Manufacturers
/ Models (HUBER Multi-Rake RakeMax),
Including All Items Required for a Complete
and Operating System, Complete in Place
(Successful Bidder to provide breakdown of
modified pricing for each Alternate "A" Bid
Item prior to Execution of Contract
Documents)

1 LS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

SUB-TOTAL ALTERNATE "B" BID ITEMS - ITEMS 11 AND 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALTERNATE "C" BID ITEMS
13 Increase / Deduct to Overall Base Bid for

Utilizing Approved Alternate Manufacturers /
Models (Duperon FlexRake), Including All
Items Required for a Complete and Operating
System, Complete in Place
(Successful Bidder to provide breakdown of
modified pricing for each Base Bid Item prior
to Execution of Contract Documents)

1 LS ($44,000.00) ($44,000.00) ($40,000.00) ($40,000.00) ($30,000.00) ($30,000.00) ($40,000.00) ($40,000.00) ($20,000.00) ($20,000.00)

14 Increase / Deduct to Overall Alternate "A" Bid
for Utilizing Approved Alternate Manufacturers
/ Models (Duperon FlexRake), Including All
Items Required for a Complete and Operating
System, Complete in Place
(Successful Bidder to provide breakdown of
modified pricing for each Alternate "A" Bid
Item prior to Execution of Contract
Documents)

1 LS $0.00 $0.00 ($40,000.00) ($40,000.00) ($30,000.00) ($30,000.00) ($40,000.00) ($40,000.00) ($20,000.00) ($20,000.00)

SUB-TOTAL ALTERNATE "C" BID ITEMS - ITEMS 13 AND 14 ($44,000.00) ($80,000.00) ($60,000.00) ($80,000.00) ($40,000.00)
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SUMMARY OF BID

BASE BID ITEMS $719,825.00 $792,083.00 $804,360.00 $814,000.00 $865,000.00

ALLOWANCE BID ITEM ITEM 8 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

TOTAL BASE BID ITEMS AND ALLOWANCE BID 
ITEMS $749,825.00 $822,083.00 $834,360.00 $844,000.00 $895,000.00

ALTERNATE "A" BID ITEMS $295,003.00 $292,526.00 $244,367.00 $226,000.00 $370,000.00

ALTERNATE "B" BID ITEMS ITEMS 11 AND 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE "C" BID ITEMS ITEMS 13 AND 14 ($44,000.00) ($80,000.00) ($60,000.00) ($80,000.00) ($40,000.00)

ITEMS 1 - 7

ITEMS 9 AND 10

ITEMS 1 - 8
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